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"Are you okay?" "We
think so." "We think
so." "Where's the

helicopter?" "It's two
minutes out." "I'll call

when I get to the
hospital." "All right."
"Are you gonna be

okay?" "Yeah, I
guess." "I think so." "I
should take her to the
hospital, Mr. Dean."
"Oh, yeah, get her in
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there right away."
"You know, I never

liked him." "I'll be right
there." "I think I might
have a right to know
exactly what's going

on around here."
"Thanks." "That was

close." "I'll take one of
these, please."

"Thanks, dear." "How's
everything coming?"

"You guys are about to
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see this." "All right,
here we go." "Pleasure
to be here." "Pleasure
to have you." "Let's
get it done." "Thank
you." "Mr. Ketchum, I
understand that you
may be here with a

rather exotic
substance."

"Contaminated with a
deadly virus, I know."
"You know, this is just
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the kind of thing we
need to put on

television... to warn
people of the dangers
of doing this kind of
thing." "I got you,

didn't I?" "The world's
largest potato." "Let's
keep it about as close

to that size as
possible, shall we?"
"That's right, as you

can see, they make it
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